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OMEGA CS 12

"[...] The great strength of the RS 12 lies in its balanced and consistent 
performance. Audio examples such as the rhythmic and rapid cannon 
fire in "The Expendables" or the powerful waves of energy emitted by 
the tesseract in "The Avengers", which appear powerful, yet even and 
balanced in the overall sound pattern, are all reproduced by Magnat's 
unit in a very reliable and harmonious manner."
 
"[...] All in all, we are extremely satisfied with the workmanship of the 
RS 12. Of course, we didn't expect a design masterpiece in this price 
range, however, the finish of the visually appealing housing has been 
applied with particular care, and we haven't found any noteworthy 
reason to complain about the rest of the components. A very solid 
performance by Magnat all round."

Read the full review at
www.areadvd.de.

Conclusion:
"One word: Reliability. This is how we would sum up Magnat's Alpha 
RS 12. Good workmanship: Check. Simple handling and setup: Check. 
Clean sound: Check. The RS 12 can lay claim to a precise performance, 
powerful presentation of atmospheric sounds, balanced harmonic 
representation and, above all, surety and speed wherever necessary. In 
keeping with the "reliability" aspect, it is by no means difficult to find 
a place for the woofer; its dimensions and weight are humane and the 
wooden finish looks good in both modern and traditional living room 
setups. The quality of workmanship is just as reliable and it generates a 
very clean image, especially for this price range. Just €399 will get you a 
solid all-round package here that leaves little to be desired, especially 
when used for film audio."

"RELIABLE PERFORMANCE AND SOLID WORKMANSHIP"

Active subwoofers up to €400
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